
Introduction

The Stealth kit is designed to address the challenges of nuisance and antisocial noise 
investigations. The system combines advanced acoustic measurement and audio 
recording capabilities of the CEL-63x series noise meters with a secure and 
unobtrusive enclosure. An external illuminated trigger button is used to activate the 
capture of noise events.

When deployed for extended periods, the system will typically be powered from an 
external 12VDC power supply (Casella Part -PC18). The CEL-63x may also be 
powered from its 3xAA internal batteries. It is safe for the batteries to remain inside the 
instrument whenever external D.C power is used. Batteries will usefully maintain 
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warranty period. In order to take advantage of this warranty, the instrument must be 
returned, carriage paid, to the manufacturer’s factory or accredited agent, where 
necessary repairs will be carried out.

Normally, the warranty period runs for 24 months from the date of receipt of goods, 
with exceptions on certain specialised components supplied by other manufacturers 
which are warranted for shorter periods. Some of the specialised components used in 
this instrument may be subject to longer guarantees by their actual manufacturers 
and in all such cases the benefits of these undertakings will be passed on to the user. 
However, Casella CEL’s liability is limited to items of their own manufacture, and they 
do not accept liability for any loss resulting from the operation or interpretation of the 
results from this equipment.

A comprehensive Instrument Calibration Maintenance Agreement (ICMA) scheme is 
available to extend the initial warranty period of this instrument. At the end of the first 
warranty period, it is recommended that the equipment be returned to the Service and 
Re-calibration Department at Bedford, where it will be inspected and entered into the 
ICMA scheme as required. The warranty will then be extended for the period stated 
on the individual schedule. Please contact your local Casella CEL agent for full details 
of this service.

In the event of a malfunction developing during the warranty period, the instrument 
should be carefully packed and returned either to Casella CEL’s local agent, or in the 
case of domestic sales, to the Service Department at Bedford.

Please include the following information:

• Instrument type(s) and serial number(s)

• Customer name and address

• Contact name and phone number

• Reason for returning the equipment, with a detailed description of the fault

The necessary adjustments or repairs will be carried out, and the instrument returned 
as soon as possible. After the warranty has expired (except on approved accounts) 
service work is undertaken against quotations, and all packing and transit costs are 
charged extra.

Pressing the audio record button will start the capture of noise event data and 
associated audio .wav files. The button’s LED will flash whilst recording is in progress. 
Pressing this button whilst recording is in progress will terminate audio recording.

Note:- time settings for minimum and maximum event duration may override the 
audio record button operation. Event recording always continues for the minimum 
time and will automatically terminate after the maximum event time has been 
reached. 

To end a Run, press the Run | Stop key - 

Stop screen will be activated and a ‘post measurement’ calibration prompt will be 
given.   Calibrate instrument as per normal.

Specification

Manufacturers Servicing and Warranty Arrangements

Case overall dimensions                        296 × 212 × 96 mm (11.7 × 8.4 × 3.8 in)

Shoulder Bag overall dimensions

In order to ensure its rigid conformity with the requirements of the specification, this 
instrument is thoroughly inspected and calibrated prior to dispatch from the factory. 
All technical information for an individual instrument is files under the instrument 
serial number. Therefore, the instrument serial number should be quoted in any 
correspondence concerning the instrument.

The manufacturers undertake to rectify any defect in the instrument that is directly 
attributable to faulty design or assembly, and which becomes apparent during the 

340 × 290× 160 mm (13.4 × 11.4 × 6.3 in)

Shipping weight                        2.3 kg (5 lbs)
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